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Fall 2020  

After School 
Enrichment 
Program for 

Llamas & 
Dolphins 
Classes  

 

Our popular afternoon enrich-

ment classes are back! Most 

classes will be held outdoors 

(weather permitting), and will 

be taught by our preschool 

teach-ers and Sports4Fun 

coaches. Classes run for 12 

weeks and begin in mid-

September. We plan to com-

bine children from the Llamas 

and Dolphins classes to meet 

the six-child minimum to hold 

classes.  

Classes run for 12 weeks 

beginning in mid-September. 

Extended day until 2:30 is 

included in the price of $250.  

 

Pricing is adjusted to $178 for 

those already enrolled in the 

extended day semester plan. 

Registration form is on the 

back of this sheet. 

Spanish with Ms. Jessica  
Mondays from 1:45-2:15  
Bienvenidos a la clase de 
Español! Come and join Señora 
Pardo for Spanish! Have fun 
learning Spanish while singing, 
playing games and acting out 
some of our favorite stories like 
Dora and Dr. Seuss.   
 
 

Garden pARTy for ART 
Lovers with Mrs. Cross  
Tuesdays from 1:30-2:00  
Students engage with skills that 
will develop an appreciation for 
the simple, joyful aspects of 
nature. Learn useful recycling 
skills, art and nature intersections 
like building a terrarium, flower 
crowns and butterfly wings, 
photos from the sun, learning 
about trees through printmaking 
and snacks for the birds. Join 
Mrs. Cross for a stroll and some 
hands-on learning as we seek 

stronger connections to God's 
gifts around us. Supply Fee: 
$20.00 

 
 

Holiday Clay with  
Mrs. Cross 
Thursdays from 2:00-2:30   
Calling all clay lovers!  If your 
hands and heART get excited 
when creating with clay then this 
class is for you. Pinch, roll, 
scratch and attach to build clay 
keepsakes for kiln firing with the 
holidays in mind. From 
Halloween to Christmas we will 
have fun making and painting 
your works.  Plus, there will be 
time to paint with clay and clay 
play. Supply Fee: $20.00 

S.T.E.M. activities with 
Mrs. Seel  
Wednesdays from 1:45-2:15 
Young children are naturally 
curious and creative. Mrs. Seel 
will offer playful STEM challenges 
to nurture your child's natural 
instincts to build, question, and 
solve problems. Students will 
have hands-on opportunities to 
build, experiment and tinker with 
magnets, a light table, Legos and 
much more! 

 

Sports4Fun Soccer 
Thursdays from 1:30-2:00 

Sports4Fun uses a professionally 
written curriculum that focuses 
on child development through 
fun games. The weekly classes 
are designed to improve 
children’s knowledge of soccer in 
an exciting environment. You will 
see an improvement in your 
child’s agility, balance and 
coordination as the season 
progresses. The educational 
aspect of these classes helps 
develop life skill such as 
communication, working in pairs 
and small groups, team work and 
discipline. 
 
 

Sports4Fun Mixed Sports 
Thursdays from 2:00-2:30  
Sports4Fun mixed sports classes 
are 30-minute introductory 
lessons in various sports. This 
season will be broken up into 
three 4-week segments where 
the children will learn more 
about the fundamentals of each 
sport. This season WPPP will be 
offering kick ball, tee ball and 
Active Mind. Active Mind sports 
focus on learning to use the mind 
and body to problem solve using 
various types of outdoor sports 
equipment. 
 
 
 



Registration Form 
Fall 2020 After School Enrichment Classes for Llamas & Dolphins Classes 

 

All classes run for 12 weeks. Dates are not consecutive.  
Extended day until 2:30 is included in all classes. Price is adjusted for those enrolled in the 

prepaid extended day program. 
 

         Spanish with Ms. Jessica on Mondays 

 Dates:  Sept. 14, 21, 28, Oct. 5, 12, 19, 26, Nov. 2, 9, 16, 23, 30 
 

         Garden pARTy for ART Lovers with Mrs. Cross on Tuesdays 
 Dates:  Sept. 15, 22, 29, Oct. 6, 13, 20, 27, Nov. 3, 10, 17, Dec. 1, 8   
 

         Holiday Clay with Mrs. Cross on Tuesdays 
 Dates:  Sept. 15, 22, 29, Oct. 6, 13, 20, 27, Nov. 3, 10, 17, Dec. 1, 8   
 

        S.T.E.M. activities with Mrs. Seel on Wednesdays 
 Dates:  Sept. 16, 23, 30, Oct. 7, 14, 21, 28, Nov. 4, 11, 18, Dec. 2, 9 
 

          Sports4Fun Soccer on Thursdays 
 Dates:  Sept. 17, 24, 31, Oct. 8, 15, 22, 29, Nov. 5, 12, 19, Dec. 3, 10 
 

          Sports4Fun Mixed Sports on Thursdays 
 Dates:  Sept. 17, 24, 31, Oct. 8, 15, 22, 29, Nov. 5, 12, 19, Dec. 3, 10 
 
 

Child’s Name: __________________________________________    Child’s Class: ____________________________ 

 

Parent’s Name: ________________________________________ 

 

E-Mail Address:  ________________________________________   Phone Number:  __________________________ 

      
 

$250.00** x ___________ # of classes = $___________________   
 
+ $20.00 materials fee for art classes only = $ ________________ 
 
**Pricing is adjusted to $178.00 for each enrichment class for those enrolled in Extended Day Prepaid 
Plan on the same day and time as the enrichment class. 
 
TOTAL DUE $ ____________________  
 

Enrichment classes will be billed to your account after determine that we are within the 6-12 student 
required class size. Please do not send payment at this time. We will contact you if the class size does 
NOT meet the requirement.    
 
 

  Date received  ___________  By________    Date billed  ___________  By _______



 


